Amendment to the Amendment in the Nature of a Substitute to Subtitle G. Budget
Reconciliation Legislative Recommendations Relating to Green Energy
Offered by Mr. Ferguson of Georgia

This amendment would reduce the maximum income threshold for EV tax credits from $800,000 to
$150,000 ($75,000 for single filers). (The No Tax Breaks for the Top 1% Amendment.)



GACMTE\WWM\IAMISC\MIN_RECON_AMDT_03.XML

AMENDMENT

OFFERED BY M¢ . Eer;iy Son

In section 36C(c)(3)(A) of the Internal Revenue
Code of 1986, as proposed to be inserted by seetion
136401, strike “$800,000” and insert “$150,000”.

In section 36C(c)(3)(B) of the Internal Revenue
Code of 1986, as proposed to be ingerted by section
136401, strike “$600,000”” and insert “$112,500".

In section 36C(c)(3)(C) of the Internal Revenue
Code of 1986, as proposed to be inserted by section
136401, strike “$400,000” and insert “$75,000”.

g:WAGN091321\G081321.127 . xml (81956212)
September 13, 2021 (10:08 p.m.)



